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TUESDAY, AUGUST 25, 2015
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA
6:00 PM

Call to Order.

Pledge of Allegiance/Invocation (Councilman Smith).
Minute Approval.

Special Presentation.

Ordinances — Final Reading:

PLANNING

a. 2015-085 Valor (0O-1 Office Zone to R-4 Special Zone). An ordinance to
amend Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 38, Zoning Ordinance, so
as to rezone properties located at 7627, 7641 7671, 7683, and 7691
Shallowford Road, more particularly described herein, from O-1 Office
Zone to R-4 Special Zone, subject to certain conditions. (District 4)
(Recommended for approval by Planning) (Deferred from

8/18/2015)

HUMAN RESOURCES
b. An ordinance to amend Part II, Chattanooga City Code, Chapter 2, Article
[II, entitled “Personnel Ordinance”.

Ordinances — First Reading:

ECONOMIC AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
a. An ordinance to amend Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 10, Article
II, Section 10-13(a), Historic Zoning.

PUBLIC WORKS AND TRANSPORTATION

Public Works

b. An ordinance to amend Chattanooga City Code, Part I, Chapter 31, Article
VIIL Division 2, Section 31-302 and Section 31-313 relative to Stormwater
Management.

Transportation

c. An ordinance to amend Chattanooga City Code. Part [I, Chapter 24,
Division 9, Sections 24-388, 24-389, 24-390, and 24-390.1, relative to
permits for valet parking in metered spaces for downtown businesses.

d. An ordinance to amend Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 24, Article
XIV, Section 24-504, Schedule IV, One-way streets. (Districts 7 & 8)
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VII. Resolutions:
GENERAL GOVERNMENT

a. A resolution adopting standard Bylaws for the City of Chattanooga

Boards and Commissions, unless said Board has enacted Bylaws specific
to that Board prior to this date or is a separate authority created by state
law or City Charter.

GENERAL SERVICES

b. A resolution authorizing the Director of General Services to extend the

agreement with Brightbridge for the administration of the EPA
Brownfield Revolving Loan Fund, for an additional one (1) year term
commencing August 1, 2015 and ending July 31, 2016, with no new funds
and according to the description of services as detailed in the Fifth
Amendment to Independent Contractor Agreement for professional
services related to EPA Revolving Loan Fund Grant.

PUBLIC WORKS AND TRANSPORTATION

Public Works

C.

A resolution to amend Resolution No. 28318 for Change Order No. 1 (Final)
for Wilder Contracting, LLC relative to Contract No. R-14-006-201,
Renaissance Park Bridge and Piers Deck Replacement, for a revised
contract amount not to exceed $67.852.00, and to release the remaining
contingency amount of $6.999.80. (District 1)

Transportation

d. A resolution authorizing the Administrator for the Department of

e.

£

Transportation to enter into a Partnership Agreement with Buzzi-Unicem
USA, Project No. T-15-025-803, for the property located at 1200 Suck
Creek Road and to accept a contribution of $29.560.00 towards the cost
of traffic signal improvement. (District 1)

A resolution authorizing the approval of Change Order No. 1 for Alta
Planning and Design relative to Contract No. T-14-005-101, Protected Bike
Lane and Neighborhood Greenway Design, for an increased amount of
$96.700.00, for a revised contract amount not to exceed $391,660.00.
(Districts 1,2,7, 8, and 9)

A resolution authorizing the approval of Change Order No. 1 for Remac,
Inc. relative to Contract No. E-13-011-201, Asphalt Crack Sealing
Requirement Contract, for a decreased amount of $1.135.00. for a revised
contract amount of $148.865.00.
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Departmental Reports:

Police.

Fire.

Economic and Community Development.
Youth and Family Development.
Transportation.

Public Works.

Finance.

IT.

Human Resources.

General Services.

S o Aanoe

Purchases.
Other Business.
a) Approval of a new liquor store
Ziya, Inc. d/b/a Chattanooga Wine and Spirits
6404 Shallowford Road
Chattanooga, TN
(District 6)
Committee Reports.

Agenda Session for Tuesday, September 1, 2015.

Recognition of Persons Wishing to Address the Council on Non-Agenda
Matters.

Adjournment.
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TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER ], 2015
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA
6:00 PM
1. Call to Order.
2. Pledge of Allegiance/Invocation (Councilman Grohn).
3. Minute Approval.
4, Special Presentation.
5. Ordinances — Final Reading:

ECONOMIC AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
a. An ordinance to amend Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 10, Article
II, Section 10-13(a), Historic Zoning.

PUBLIC WORKS AND TRANSPORTATION

Public Works

b. An ordinance to amend Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 31, Article
VIII, Division 2, Section 31-302 and Section 31-313 relative to Stormwater
Management.

Transportation

c. An ordinance to amend Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 24,
Division 9, Sections 24-388, 24-389, 24-390, and 24-390.1, relative to
permits for valet parking in metered spaces for downtown businesses.

d. An ordinance to amend Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 24, Article
X1V, Section 24-504, Schedule IV, One-way streets. (Districts 7 & 8)

6. Ordinances — First Reading: (None)
7. Resolutions:
MAYOR’S OFFICE

a. A resolution confirming and approving the appointment of John Foy as a
member of the Electric Power Board of Chattanooga from the effective
date hereof until April 15. 2020, and thereafter until his successor is
appointed and qualified.

b. A resolution to confirm the reappointment of Jim Hall to the Metropolitan
Airport Board.

c. A resolution to confirm the appointment of Kim Gavin and reappointment
of Dan Walker to the Library Board.
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10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

d. A resolution to confirm the appointment of Trevor Atchley to the Beer

and Wrecker Board.

e. A resolution to confirm the appointment of Erica Lewis to the Tree

Commission.

f. A resolution to confirm the appointments of Amy Jenkins and Rebecca

Miller to the Youth and Family Development Board.

Departmental Reports:

S o aAanoe

Police.

Fire.

Economic and Community Development.
Youth and Family Development.
Transportation.

Public Works.

Finance.

IT.

Human Resources.

General Services.

Purchases.

Other Business.

a)

Approval of a new liquor store

Owners: Dharmeshku B. Patel and Ankurkumar K. Patel
Northgate Liquor

5241 Hwy. 153, Suite 1

Chattanooga, TN 37343

(District 3)

Committee Reports.

Agenda Session for Tuesday, September 8, 2015.

Recognition of Persons Wishing to Address the Council on Non-Agenda
Matters.

Adjournment.
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Proposed City Council Purchases 08-25-15

DEPARTMENT ITEM BIDS BIDS LOWEST/BEST
REQUISITION NO. | DESCRIPTION | REQUESTED | RETURNED BIDDER CcosT DN SIS
Blanket Contract Renewal
for Fueling Station Repair
Blanket Services. There were 4
Contract direct bid solicitations and
R45591 Renewal for S Estimated - . we received 2 responses
. outhern Pump Municipal Service ) .
General Fueling 4 2 & Tank $220,000 Station in the publically
Services Station Annually advertised bid
Repair proceedings. Southern
Services Pump & Tank, was the
lowest responsible bidder
that met specifications.
A New Blanket Contract
for Light & Heavy Duty
A New Automotive Parts. There
Blanket were 12 direct bid
R113291 Contract for Estimated solicitations and we
General Light & 12 4 Lee-Smith Inc. | $3.000.000 |Municipal Garage| received 4 responses in
Services Heavy Duty Annually the publically advertised
Automotive bid proceedings. Lee-
Parts Smith Inc.. was the lowest
responsible bidder that
met specifications.
The Purchase of Salt for
Roadway Deicing. There
were 4 direct bid
The Purchase solicitations and we
R119523 of Salt for Claiborne received 2 responses in
Public Works Roadway 4 ) Hauling Sl AZ000 GengiRl Bugt the publically advertised
Deicing bid proceedings. Claiborne

Hauling . was the lowest
responsible bidder that
met specifications.




City of Chattanooga

Mayor Andy Berke

August 18, 2015

Mr. Cary Bohannon

Director of General Services
General Services Department
274 East 10" Street
Chattanooga, TN 37402

Subject: Contract Renewal of Blanket PO No. 511935 — Fueling Station Repair Services —
Fleet Management Division — General Services Department

Dear Mr. Bohannon:

Council approval is recommended to renew Blanket PO No. 511935 for Fueling Station
Repair Services for the Fleet Management Division, General Services Department. The
City of Chattanooga is renewing the fourth (4"') and last contract renewal option for twelve
(12) months through October 18,2016 for an estimated annual amount of $220,000.
Council approved Blanket PO No. 511935 on October 18, 2011, second (2“d) renewal on
October 1, 2013, and third renewal by Ordinance No. 12794 on January 7, 2014. A copy of
the signed letter from vendor, amount released from Blanket PO No. 511935, and a copy of
the contract is enclosed.

I recommend renewing Blanket PO No. 511935 for Fueling Station Repair Services to
Southern Pump & Tank.

Respectfully yours,

Bonnie Woodward
Director of Purchasing

BW/mlm

Attachments

101 East 11th Street, Suite G13 e Chattanooga, TN 37402 OFFICE: (423) 757-5184 ¢ FAX: (423) 757-7201
www.chattanooga.gov



City of Chattanooga
Mayor Andy Berke

July 8, 2015

Southern Pump & Tank
Attn: Josh Thomas
2710 John Deere Drive
Sulte 207

Knoxville, TN 37917

Subject: 511935 ~ Fuellng Statlon Repair Services

Dear Mr. Thomas:

The City of Chattanooga would like to extend the above referenced contract for an additlonal
twelve (12) months at the same contracted price(s).

The new explration date will be October 18, 2016,

Please render the appropriate signature below and return via fax to 423-643-7244 or
by email to nimckeael@chattanooga.qgov if you agree to renewal.

As always, we appremate the good service you have rendered in the past, and we look forward to

working with you in the ture
~ 3
D Date: 2)/// 7 // 5

Signed..., /‘

FEIV' /0 P
A
,///// //.‘-"‘('C l‘
(/}"/f" /"'(/{‘
Mark L. McKeel, Buyer

City of Chattanooga
Phone: (423) 643-7236 Fax: (423) 643-7244

101 East 11th Street, Suite G13 ¢ Chattanooga, TN 37402 OFFICE: {423) 757-51 84 = FAX: (423) 757-7201
www.chattanooga.gov
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Purchase Order Printed: 03/26/2015

BLANKET
City of Chattanooga
101 East 11th Street, Suite G13
Chattanooga, TN 37402
Vendor Number: 599737
Vendor Alternate ID: 2303
SPATCO PO Date: 19-OCT-11
2710 John Deere Dr Ste 207 Buyer: Mark McKeel
Knoxville, TN 37917 FOB: DESTINATION
Terms: Immediate

| Accounts Payable Division
City of Chattanooga
101 East 11th Street, Suite 101
Chattanooga, TN 37402

isltion Number,

\Unit Price

Ordering Dept.: Flest Management
Buyer: Geoffrey Hipp 423-757-4758

DESCRIPTION:
This shall be a twelve (12) month blanket contract for Fusling Statlon Service & Repalr Services for the Fleet Management Dlvision. The contract may be renewed for four (4)

additional twelve (12) month terms under the same Terms and Conditions by Mutual Agreement. The City of Chattanooga and the Contractor may bilaterally extend the contract
by Written Confirmation by both parties at least 30 days prlor to the contract's current expiration date into any successive term as provided hereln,

NOTES:

The bld submltted by Southern Pump & Tank Co. dated 8-10-11 Is hereby made a part of this contract.
Payment Terms: Net 30 days

Delivery Terms: As Needed

PRICE ESCALATION CLAUSE:
If as a result of a general change In prices or discounts, the contractor has changed prices to all of Its customers, then, at the time of contract renewal, the price under this

contract may be adjusted accordingly after acceptance. All price increases must be justified by providing a copy of the prevailing labor wage or material cost increases. Prompt
notice of price changes (Increases or reductions) must be furnished to the Purchasing Agent at least 30 days prior to the requested effective date and the prices for these
services/materials shall remaln firm for twelve (12) months. The effectlve date of price Increases shall be the date the Purchasing Agent accepts the price changes or the effective
date of increase stated by contractor's notice to Purchasing Agent, whichever is later,

APPROVED BY CITY COUNCIL ON OCTOBER 18, 2011

CONTRACT BEGINNING/ENDING DATES:
10-19-2011 TO 10-19-2012

Vendor Contact: Josh Thomas
Phone: 800-249-4921

Fax: 865-546-5402
jody.sailors@southernpump.com

* NOTICE !
TERMS AND CONDITIONS set forth in our Bid or Quotation, see conditions attached or incorporated herein by reference becoms a
part of this order. This Purchase Order valid only when signed or electronically approved by the Finance Officer.

Electronic approval is on record in the purchasing information system which asserts that unencumbered appropriation is available to
meet the expenditure covered by this Purchase Order; and further authorizes payment upon proper certification of receipt of goods

and/or services.



P
Purchase Order Printed: og?2e6/228f1;

BLANKET

City of Chattanooga

101 East 11th Street, Suite G13

Chattanooga, TN 37402

Vendor Number: §99737
Vendor Alternate ID:; 2303
NI | SPATCO PO Date: 19-OCT-11
n'| 2710 John Deere Dr Ste 207 Buyer: Mark McKeel
Knoxville, TN 37917 FOB: DESTINATION
Terms: Immediate

Accounts Payable Division
City of Chattanooga

101 East 11th Street, Suite 101
Chattanooga, TN 37402

y |

Change Order #1

Contract has been extended an additional twelve (12) months.
The new contract performance dated Is October 18, 2014.

City Councll approved contract renewal on October 1, 2013.

2nd Renewal

NOTICE *++kssasnsniknisshuhsnsibisssmnnn

TERMS AND CONDITIONS set forth in our Bid or Quotation, see conditions attached or incorporated herein by reference become a
part of this order. This Purchase Order valid only when signed or slectronically approved by the Finance Officer.

Electronic approval is on record in the purchasing information system which asserts that unencumbered appropriation is available to
meet the expenditure covered by this Purchase Order; and further authorizes payment upon proper certification of receipt of goods
and/or services.



Page 3 of 7
Purchase Order Printed: 03/26/2015

BLANKET
City of Chattanooga
101 East 11th Street, Suite G13
Chattanooga, TN 37402
Vendor Number; 599737
Vendor Alternate ID: 2303
\ | SPATCO PO Date: 19-OCT-11
) | 2710 John Deere Dr Ste 207 Buyer: Mark McKeel
| Knoxville, TN 37917 FOB: DESTINATION
| Terms: Immediate

Accounts Payable Division
City of Chattanooga

101 East 11th Street, Suite 101
Chattanooga, TN 37402

il _Bld Number

AT IR T e T T T Quantityr [0 I [ Un R Pricam s Total i

Change Order #2

Contract has been extended an addltional twelve (12) months.
The new contract performance date Is October 18, 2015,

Ordinance No. 12794 was approved by City Council on January 7, 2014
to move threshold amount from $10,000 to $25,000.

Purchases from October 19, 2013 to July 22, 2014 total $11,935.79.
Adding $24,000 to Amount Limit.

3rd Renewal

NOTICE * ik
TERMS AND CONDITIONS set forth in our Bid or Quotation, see conditions attached or incorporated herein by reference become a
part of this order. This Purchase Order valid only when signed or electronically approved by the Finance Officer.

Electronic approval is on record In the purchasing Information system which asserts that unencumbered appropriation Is available to
meet the expenditure covered by this Purchase Order; and further authorizes payment upon proper certification of receipt of goods
and/or services.



Page 4 of 7
Purchase Order Printed: 03,26/2015

BLANKET
City of Chattanooga
101 East 11th Street, Suite G13
Chattanooga, TN 37402
Vendor Number: 599737
Vendor Alternate ID: 2303
SPATCO PO Date: 19-OCT-11
2710 John Deere Dr Ste 207 Buyer: Mark McKeel
Knoxville, TN 37917 FOB: DESTINATION
f Terms: Immediate
1 Accounts Payable Division
= “l City of Chattanooga
i @|' 101 East 11th Street, Suite 101
S Chattanooga, TN 37402
=

niNU T Bld Number! T

UnitPrice. [0 . Total |

Change Order #3

Price increase on line# 4 for Service Call Fee (Normal Business Hours)
from $86.78 to $91.20, an increase of less than 1% total.

The price Increase went into effect In January 2015.

03/10/15 mim

* * * NOTICE 2 o e i
TERMS AND CONDITIONS set forth In our Bid or Quotation, see conditions attached or incorporated herein by reference become a
part of this order. This Purchase Order valid only when signed or electronically approved by the Finance Officer.

Electronic approval is on record in the purchasing information system which asserts that unencumbered appropriation s available to

meet the expenditure covered by this Purchase Order; and further authorizes payment upon proper certification of recelpt of goods
and/or services.



Page 5 of 7
Purchase Order Printed: 0312612015

BLANKET

City of Chattanooga

101 East 11th Street, Suite G13

Chattanooga, TN 37402

Vendor Number: 599737
Vendor Alternate |ID: 2303
SPATCO PO Date: 19-OCT-11
2710 John Deere Dr Ste 207 Buyer: Mark McKeel
Knoxville, TN 37917 FOB: DESTINATION
Terms: Immediate _
i)

Accounts Payable Division
City of Chattanooga
101 East 11th Street, Suite 101
Chattanooga, TN 37402

Change Order #4

Contract has been extended an additional twelve (12) months.
The new contract performance dated is October 18, 2015.

Clty Council approved contract renewal on March 24, 2015.

3rd Renewal (See Change Order #2)

NOTICE
TERMS AND CONDITIONS set forth in our Bid or Quotation, see conditions attached or Incorporated herein by reference become a
part of this order. This Purchase Order valid only when signed or electronically approved by the Finance Officer.

Electronic approval is on record In the purchasing information system which asserts that unencumbered appropriation is available to
meet the expenditure covered by this Purchase Order; and further authorizes payment upon proper certification of recelpt of goods
and/or services.



Page 6 of 7
Purchase Order Printed: 03/26/2015

BLANKET

City of Chattanooga

101 East 11th Street, Suite G13

Chattanooga, TN 37402

Vendor Number: 599737
Vendor Alternate ID; 2303

Tl SPATCO PO Date: 19-OCT-11
)| 2710 John Deere Dr Ste 207 Buyer: Mark McKeel
Knoxville, TN 37917 FOB: DESTINATION
il Terms: Immediate

Accounts Payable Division
City of Chattanooga

101 East 11th Street, Suite 101
Chattanooga, TN 37402

_Req

fem 1D = ltam

Labor - Repalr and Service for Fuellng Stations at 12th Street, ' $ 61,0000
Moccasin Bend, and Amnicola (Normal Business Hours}

Descrption,

2 Labor - Repair and Service for Fuellng Statlons at 12th Street, 0.00 Hour $ 91.5000 $0.00
Moccasin Bend, and Amnicola (After Hours - Weekdays)

3 Labor - Repair and Service for Fueling Statlons at 12th Street, 0.00 Hour $ 122.0000 $0.00
Moccasin Bend, and Amnicola (Weekends and Holidays)

4 Service Call Fee {Normal Business Hours) 0.00 Each $ 91.2000 $0.00

5 Service Call Fee (After Hours - Weekdays) 0.00 Each $130.1700 $0.00

6 Service Call Fee (Weekends and Holldays) 0.00 Each $ 173.5600 $0.00

7 Parts & Materials (20% markup over cost) 0.00 Each $ 1.0000 $0.00

TOTAL: $.00

NOTICE *****
TERMS AND CONDITIONS set forth In our Bid or Quotation, see conditions attached or incorporated herein by reference become a
part of this order. This Purchase Order valid only when signed or electronically approved by the Finance Officer.

Electronic approval Is on record in the purchasing Informatlon system which asserts that unencumbered appropriation is available to
meet the expenditure covered by this Purchase Order; and further authorizes payment upon proper cerification of receipt of goods

and/or services.



City of Chattanooga

Mayor Andy Berke

August 17, 2015

Mr. Cary Bohannon

Director of General Services
General Services Department
274 East 10" Street
Chattanooga, TN 37402

Subject: 113291 /303770 -Light & Heavy Duty Automotive Parts — Fleet Management — General
Services Department

Dear Mr. Bohannon:

Council approval is recommended to issue a twelve (12) month citywide blanket contracts for Light &
Heavy Duty Automotive Parts with the option for four (4) additional twelve (12) month terms for an
estimated annual amount of $3,000,000.

The invitation to bid was sent to twelve (12) vendors as well as formally advertised. Bids were received
from four (4) vendors shown below. Bids are retained on file in the Purchasing Office for your review

upon request.

Vendors
Lee-Smith Inc. Uni-Select USA, Inc.
O’Reilly Auto Parts C-Com

I recommend awarding the blanket contract for Light & Heavy Duty Automotive Parts to Lee-Smith Inc.
as the best complete bids meeting specifications for the City of Chattanooga.

Respectfully yours,

Bonnie Woodward
Director of Purchasing

BW/mlm

101 East 11th Street, Suite G13 e Chattanooga, TN 37402 OFFICE: (423) 757-5184 » FAX: (423) 757-7201
www.chattanooga.gov



Lee-Smith Company
PO Box 72843

2600 8™ Avenue
Chattanooga, TN 37407

Advance Auto Parts
4970 Highway 58
Chattanooga, TN 37416

Auto Plus / Uni-Select
6166 Preservation Drive
Chattanooga, TN 37416

Mountain View Chevrolet
310 East 20" Street
Chattanooga, TN 37408

Mountain View Ford
301 East 20" Street
Chattanooga, TN 37408

Fleet Pride
2000 East 24" Street
Chattanooga, TN 37407

NAPA Genuine Auto Part
5420 Peachtree Industrial
Norcross, GA 30071

AutoZone
123 Front Street
Memphis, TN 38103

Carquest

Marshall Mize Ford
5348 Highway 153
Hixson, TN 37343

O’Reilly Auto Parts
233 South Patterson Avenue
Springfield, MO 65801

Ken Smith Auto Parts
4140 Jersey Pike
Chattanooga, TN 37421



Requisition:
Bid #:

Description

1

(=

Facifity No

113291

303770

Light & Heavy Duty
Automotive Parts &
Accessories

Item Description
Fleelguard, Air Filter,
Part No AF25707
WIX, Arr Filler,
No 46870
Fram, Arr Filter,
Part No CA10242
WIX, Ar Filter,
No 46935
Fram, Air Filter,
No CAS5056
WIX, Air Filter,
No 46814
Fram, Air Filter,
No AF4619
WIX, Ar Filter,
No 46134
MalorcraRt, Ar Filter,
Part No 7C329601A
WIX, Arr Filter,
Parl No_ 49883
MTC, Arr Filter,
No FA1883
Motorcraft, Batlery-96R,
No BXT-96R
$SB, Batlery-96R, Part
Na 96R72
EXI, Battery-96R,
Part No 96RC
Exide, Baltery-Extreme 65X,
Part No. 65E108
SSB, Ballery-Exireme 65X,
No 65EXT
EXI, Battery-Extreme 65X,
Part No 65X
Interslate, Battery-Group 31T,
Part No 31XHD
$SB, Battery-Group 31T,
PartNo 31-5T
EXI, Battery-Group 31T,
Part No 31XHD
Exide, Battery-Stud Type 12V,
Part No HP310
SSB, Battery-Slud Type 12V, Part
No 31-5
EXI, Batlery-Stud Type 12V,
Part No 31XHD
LeBrie, Bearing,
No HYV30066
BCA, Bearing,
No 453A
Accuride, Sleel Wheel,
No AS50487PKWHT21
PDC, Steel Wheel,
No. Sw22 5H
Webb, Brake Drum, Part No. 666618
Raybeslos, Brake Pads-Front,
Part No. PGD931M
BB, Brake Pads-Fronl,
Part No. SM931
WAG, Brake Pads-Fronl,
Part No. MX931
Raybeslos, Brake Pads-Rear,
Pait No PGD932C
BB, Brake Pads-Rear,
No SC932
WAG, Brake Pads-Rear,
Parl No QC932
Haldex, Brake Shoe-16 5 x 6,
Pail N (3G47 150R

Fait

Part

\'eesm\\

Unit
Cost

s’ 3977

$ 1251

$ 11035

S Twan

$ 7633

$ 7633

$ 1470

$ 7705

$ 18830

$ 3905

$ 3905

$ 5244

Qty.

155

44

28

87

89

25

30

23

145

70

Extended

$

]

Price

1,630 57

144 00

957 90

550 44

3,089 80

14201 14

6,640 71

6,793 37

367 50

231150

4,330 90

5,662 25

2,73350

078 a0

% Bid

J-54%

C+5%

J-54%

C+10%

C+15%

C+8%

C+8%

C+15%

C+15%

C+10%

J-40%

J40%

C+15%

Unit Cost w/
Percentage

$ 1829

s 5800

$ 1470

s 126 90

$ 8244

$ 8244

$ 16 91

Is 8861

5 207 13

$ 2343

s ]

5 37 52

Ext. Cost w/
% Total

s 749 89

] 11,270.00

5 440 20

5 6 44

$ 3,55320 :

5 15,092 30

s 717228

s 733716

5 42275

s 2,658 30

5 4,763 99

s 3,397.35

3 1.E40.10

oo
Uit
Cost  Qty.

Extended
Price

% Bid Percentage

Unit Cost w/ Ext. Cost w/
% Total

il

P
W
o®e

Unit
Price

$ 4419

$ 0

S0

S 8304

$ 9781

& 6216

5 92218

$ 2500

No Bnd

No Bid

5 2001

5 187

{ Extended
Oy, Price

4 s 181179

20

LE- T Toa 80

44 5 473 00

m  §8 Zansm
194 $ 1897514
o162
-k 5

B 202348

625 00

4101895

70 "% 237090

% Bid

-41%

A%

419

1%

-41%

A1

A1

-41%

410

-41%

Unit Cost w/ Ext. Cost w/
Percentage . % Total

1,068 87
130 80
45415
s el 3 )
] 5260 § 1470 00
3 5771 $ 11,195 74
& 730
3 5437 %

4,838 93

3 1475 8 368 75

241370

$ 1998 ' § 1,398 60

$ 73865

$ 1232

$ 1704

$ 1137

$ 11507

$ 13052

5 14931

$ 14931

No Bid

$ 108 58
$ 57061

$ 8754

a1

30

165

44

Fi]

194

87

30
23

T

Extended
Price

$ 3,01965

5 36960

$ 264120

5 500 28

5 e

$ 2532088 :

$ 1298997

5 13328840

3,257 40
$ 1312403

5 BMI

5 3Wam

% Bid

-55%

-55%

-55%

-55%

K™

34

-40%

o

0%
-58%

<35W

Unit Cost w/
Percentage

$ 3314

$ 554

5 s

] o5

$ 3314

$ 89 89

3 3 56

3 108 58
$ 239 66

¥ ran

Ext. Costw/
% Total

$ 1,358.74

$ 166 20

$ 1,188 85

s 48508

5 212660

$ 6,429 18

$ 7.820.43

5 T35

$ 3,257 40
551218

@

5 6,423 00

5 E545320




BHH. Broke Shoe10.5 x 8,

Part No SF4515Q20

MER, Brake Shoe-16.5 x 6,

Part No MR4715QH23P
"Sylvania, Bulb,
No 184NA
"EIK, Bulb, )
No 184A
WLT, Bulb,
Part No 194NA
, AIC Delco, Bulb,
No 3157
EIK, Bulb,
No 3157
WLT, Bulb,
Part No 3157
GE, Bulb,
No 1156
EIK, Bulb,
Part No 1156
WL, Bulb,
Part Na: 1158
GE| Bull,
Part Mo 1157,
Eil, B,
Part No. 1167
WLT, Bule,
Pt Mo 1187
GE, Bulb,
No 194
EIK, Bulb,
No 184
WLT, Bulb,
Parl No 194
GE, Bulb,
No 9007
EIK, Bulb,
Mo GDOTEP
WLT. Bul,
Pt b 007
Gk, Bull,
Pari Mo, A8
EIK, Bulb,
Mo 295
WLT, Bulh,
Part Mo, 806

Bult-Long Quarez 15000

Guinde. Dfums,
Part fa B5884F
WER., Uhrureen,
Fait Ho BEAE4F
Blastie E-Chuin,
ParlNo 10-8

Past

Part

Par

Pait’

Matorcrah, Electric Fan Assembly, Part!

No RF272/8W1Z6C607C

Molorcraft Electric Fan Assembly,

Part No RF272

Cyclo, Spray Brake Cleaner,

PartNo C111

QORC, Spray Brake Cleaner,

Part Na 72408

AXC, Spray Brake Cleaner,

Part No 0732

Mack, Steering Axle Hub Assembly,

Parl No 21728458

Cummins, Recon Turbocharger,

Part No 4955462RX

Hendrickson, Bolster Spring,

Parl No HDK64179037
EUC, Bolster Spring,
No E14044
Gales, Fitting-8G8FJX,
Part No G25170-0808
Gales, Fitting-HGBFJX,
Parl No G25170-0606

Part

Lincoln, Fitting-Grease-1/4-26 x 1/&-80,

Parl No 116S-228

EDE, Fitting-Grease-1/4-28 x 1/8-90,

Part No 613000

Lincoln, Fitting-IH Grease 1/8 ST,

Pant Mo 1HME1

$ 1410

,$ 10238

s 7@z

$ 21884

$ 494 00

| 82,468 40

$ 21010 |

a3

90

)

12

78

4000

a1
453

Fel

5

5
5

4233

1285

[

2520

G702

2314

50220

7086 64

Gad 0o

502872

10,080 00

2,964 00

9.87360

3,361 80

207 05

(EFET

14,75

144 18

541400 W 5 124200 a8 a3 760
5 3564 30 § 106920 48W S 1660 638 00
CHE% S [T 3400
$ 051 40 5§ W40 MW S T 1200
§ fea a0 3 HE0 % S 04l 1800
CH15% $ 059 Ay
§ 087  BF S 4731 1% 8 034 ;3 2822
.$ o070 83 s 5810  -30% S 049 4067
CotE% S 040 14 60
s oM W5 1517 % S [ BEA
s om w s o8 0% 8 o2 999
CHEW S nes T2
§ 02 W s T2 4% 0§ 015§ 435
5 om n ] T8 3§ 022 638
C+15%  $ o2 7580
$ 022 90 § 1980  41% $ 013§ 170
§ 035 L] 5 3B 0% 025 2250
GHisk S 507 11154
5 448 B & 9856 | M § 264 & 5808
‘ $ 482 22 H 10164 30% 3 323 7106
GHs%  § (L] 2652
§ 045 W/ 0§ N 4% 8 [ T2
& 07 26 H 1898 -30% $ 051 1320
Cy15%  § 1672 68124 No Bid o B
CoaO% S 1262 878436 No Bid
$ 32631 78 $ 2545218 -58% 137 05 10,689 90
(=S 10 75300 No Bid e Bist
Ge10% 3 240 89 5,531 50
$31591 23§ TP AN § 18639 $ 428607, 517060, 23 $ 32380 OW S 170,80 3,073 80
C+15% | § 290 11,60000
$ 280 4000 S5 WfB000 . M S 159§ 636000
1, . $ 220 4000 S B8G000 0% § 220 8,800 00
C+15% . § 568 10 3,408 60 No Bid Mo Bid
CH10% 1§ 271524 10,860 96 No Bid Mo Bid
CH15% ' § 24162 2,865 92 No Bid —
7:‘_;»68»51_74 16 5 WeE2T A8 3 376 84 6,020 44
C+15%  § 581 23821 s 681 41§ 27101 1% 8 390 15990 5 600 41 s MnE 2w S 487 199 67
Cel5% 3 450 2,047 50 $ 465 455 § 211575 1%  § 274§ 1,24570‘5 469 455 5 21085 Gk S 375 1,706 25
Cel5% | § 068 1700 No Bid }
$ o 25 £ 1925 0% 3 ui 1925
Cot5% 3 186 165 54 M B




ELIE, FIMinG-Grease 16 8T,
Part Na. 600000
Old Domimion, Suction Impeller,
Part Mo LGTHT 33
Flestguini, Fuet Friter,
Part No. FS16884F
WK, Fuiel Filler,
Part Mo 337 14
Warpretiah, Fusl Filter, Part
Mo, F45:17 14 | HARZS1GSCA
WX, Fuel Filtes
Ban No. 33505
Havistar, Fuel Filter, Part
Mo 18TED42C02

WIX, Fuel Filter, Part No WF10149

" Moloreraft, Fuse, Part
No 2MS5Z3155CA
WIX, Fuse, Part
No 33595
Fuse Holder,
Part No 88766
WIX, Fuse Holder,
Part No 33766
BUS, Fuse Holder, Part
No BP/HHC-RP
Fuse Holder-12GA 30 AMP Covered,
Part No 90212
LIT, 12GA 30 AMP Covered Fuse
Holder, Par
No FHA2BP
BUS, 12GA 30 AMP Covered Fuse
Halder, Part
No BP/HHM-RP
Ram Products, Fuse Tap-Mini,
Part No. XLFFHM-200
. LIT, Fuse Tap-Mini, Pan
| No FHM200BP
BUS, Fuse Tap-Mini, Part
No BP/HHH-RP
Gang Junction/Terminal Block.
Part No J85
BWD, Gang Junction /Terminal Bk
Part Mo JES
S0, Gihg JunctisnTenminm Block_
Part Mo JBS
Nivvistar, Gashet-Aude
Farl Mo, 356618041
Hitah Pin, Parl
Mo, BPBH0ES
CUR, Hitch Pin,
Part Ko, 25080
Nadstar, I Poly v Beil.
Part Mo 351558801
Gales. Poly V Bell, Pait
: No K060470
{Navistar, IH Poly V Belt, Part
.. __ . No 1842457C1
Getes, Poly V Bell, Part
: No K080825 .
Modine, Slerling Condor Radiator,
art Vo, MENIZAS1449GR
ir Gavemor, Part
No 275491
~ MGM, Parking Brake Chamber,
Part No 03030
BBH, Parking Brake Chamber,
Pant N OETS3I0N0
Gotes, Hydrauhic Hose 307,
Part Ho. f4pg
Gales, Hydrouhe Mo 25
Part No. 704845
Matarcral. Ignition Coil,
Pan Mo WWTZ12020848
BV, fgnstinn Cail,
Part No E
TR Igntion Cail,
Pait Mo FOSOST
1Detroit, Injector Seals, Part
No 05234699
FPD, Injector Seals,
Part No FP52346349

s;

| $1.29760 _

946

1000

A2 67

1000

(ko]

536

535

052

125925

935

3529

503

196

4583

8

57

57

a3

30

29

40

50

238

1023

24

.8

5

12,376 00

350 02

1,630 00

1,191 96

1,310 00

4770

35226

176 68

160 50

1508

RM

A

370078

374 00

1,764 50

1,197 14

2,00508 _

1,649 68

C+12%

J-54%

C+10%

C+15%

C+10%

C+15%

Co 15

C+15%

C*+15%

C+15%

C+15%

C+15%

Lo 15%

C+15%

C+15%

C+15%

C+15%

C+15% |

C+10%

Coihd

1,386 11

435

1100

1100

104

158

618

815

60 00

2190

M ai

1448,14

10,75

4058

578

225 ;

5041

$

5

$

$

$

s

$

s

$

5

)

13,861 10

160 95

179300

1,370 88

1,441 00

5512

3792

40527

20328

184 50 '

1,740 00

266 00

41244

4,344 42

43000

2,029 00

1.37564

230175

181476

50

No Bid

$ 1128

3oaur

$ 4318

$ 827

: $2018

s 319

5 700

No Bid

No Bid

BRI

s A
o i

No Bid

$ I3

5 ng2

3 234

3 6042

No Bid

37

163

28

131

53

24

57

k|

50

1023

41773

1,022 01

1,208 32

82137

1069 54

76 56

39843

693 00

205 08

358,01

1,886 50

1,575 56

2,618 88

181512

-41%

“41%

41%

-41%

A1

-41%

A%

%

41%

A 1%

-41%
-41%

-“41%

1%

666

370

2548

1e

1239

mnos

1TEa

bt}

3m

2975

s

£ 7

£ 3

3
3

: ]

$

246 42

603 10

71344

484 70

na

4512

23484

408 87

12008

21036

1,11300
930 58

154473

1,071.00

$

$

$

nar

No Bid

18 82

1045 '

7198 .

1045

118

1083

B 11

No Bid

5

1189

3242

No Bid

1040

46 49

654

00

o

)

ED

163

28

1

53

24

57

%9

A0

50

38

1023

34

696 34

1,703 35

2,01572

1,368 95

2301

26763

‘22388

389 04

419 20

2,324 50

1,556 52

2,508 42

88544

1848

-55%

-55%

-55%

-55%

0%

-25%

20%

-20%

0%

0%

-20%

-35%

0%

$

0s7 $

847 §

470 §

3240 s

ms

164 %

1093

"

608 $

129§

1401 §

2594 §

1048 §
4540 5
=L 3

523 %
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City of Chattanooga

Mayor Andy Berke

August 7, 2015

Mr. Lee Norris, Administrator
Public Works Department
Development Resource Center
1250 Market Street, Suite 2100
Chattanooga TN, 37402

Subject: R119523 — Salt for Roadway Deicing - Public Works Department
Dear Mr. Norris;

Council approval is recommended for the purchase of Salt for Roadway Deicing, as
needed by the Public Works Department. The amount of this purchase is $117,420.00.

The invitation to bid was sent to four (4) vendors as well as formally advertised. Two (2)
bids were received. The bids are retained on file in the Purchasing Office for your review
upon request. A spreadsheet showing the bids received is attached.

[ recommend awarding the contract to Claiborne Hauling, based on the lowest bid
meeting the specifications for the City of Chattanooga.

Respectfully yours,
Bonnie Woodward

Purchasing Agent

BW/wt
Attachment

101 East 11th Street, Suite G13 o Chattanooga, TN 37402 OFFICE: (423) 757-5184 ¢ FAX: (423) 757-7201
www.chattanooga.gov
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